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My dear little children, praised be Jesus!
My dear children, it is I, your Lady of Akita. It is I, your Lady of all Nations who wept and cried tears of 
blood through the statue in Akita. I wish to draw you closer to this apparition site so that you may hear 
my words again. I came for two purposes: 1) to warn you of a great chastisement that God the Father 
may send to you that will be terrible, and 2) to eliminate this, to draw you closer to the Eucharistic Heart 
of my Son Jesus. I wish you to understand that it is only through the power of the Eucharist and with full 
confidence and trust in Him, Jesus through the Blessed Sacrament, that will eliminate, or alleviate, the 
chastisement that is to come. 

My little children, the Reign of the Eucharistic Heart of my Son has begun. I told you in 2000 to 2001 
that my Immaculate Heart has begun to reign and will ultimately coincide with the Triumph of Jesus in 
the Blessed Sacrament. This has been fulfilled. Now begins another period, my little ones, the period of 
decision for mankind. If this world will not turn to the Eucharistic Jesus in hope and in faith, you will 
ultimately destroy yourselves. Hear me, my dear little children. I said, you will destroy yourselves. 

My Son is real and He is truly present inside you after every Mass. He lives in the presence of His Most 
Holy Eucharist, and you can meet Him and come face to face with Him when you pray and venerate His 
Most Holy Eucharistic Heart. He’s here to heal you, to cleanse you, and to help you on your journey 
back home to the Father. However, it is necessary that you amend your ways and live every message that 
I am giving to you.

I love you, my dear children, and it was me, your mother, coming to Akita to warn you of the disastrous 
consequences that are still yet to come. Satan is not cast out from earth yet and his lies are prevalent. He 
waits for you. He waits for each and every single one of you. He waits to devour you and your young.
That is why I implore you with my most Immaculate Heart to come back to Jesus, to the blessed, holy, 
sacrament. Venerate His Eucharistic Heart and love Him, and realize again, dear children, that you 
should never judge one another for you do not know and you do not see with the eyes of God. You do 
not know who it is who has received communion before or after you. Therefore, be careful lest you 
offend my Son in the presence of His Holy Sacrifice of the Mass and dwelling within souls. Be very 
careful, my dear children, of your actions and the way you perceive others. Let your prayer always be, 
“Oh, Lord, let me see and love others the way you would have me see and love others. Oh, Lord, let me 
judge not, but your will be done to me and to all others I come in contact with.”

I wish you to surrender yourselves to Jesus and to be conscious of your actions and your thoughts. Love 
one another. I cannot stress this enough. I love you. Please love others the way Jesus loves you. Show 
mercy on the poor, even the ignorant, those who do not want to hear you or hear the voice of God. For 
them I urge you to pray and do sacrifices. This will all alleviate the pain and suffering in my Immaculate 
Heart and will draw you closer to the Eucharistic Jesus. But, however, the choice is yours. I wept in 
Akita, crying tears of blood and human tears for you to amend your ways. Do not let me cry again here.
Do not let me cry again in Emmitsburg either. Please, do not offend Our Lord! Love one another and 
pray for conversion and peace. He is real. He is here with me. Wherever I am, He is with me. I cannot 
go anywhere my Son is not. If I did, it would only lead me and others into folly, but I do not. I only 
appear where my Son is. And where He is, I am. And wherever my Son is, you will find eternal life.
Come, little ones, and join the reign, the Reign of my Immaculate Heart and the Reign of Jesus’ Most 
Scared Heart, present in the Most Holy Blessed Sacrament of the Altar.

Now is the time for humanity to make their decision, either for God or against God. This will ultimately 
determine which chastisements befall you. Pray, pray, pray, dear children and be patient. You will soon 



know where the world is being led, either by you, Satan, or God himself. Who is leading the world?
Jesus is present in the world. Therefore, I invite you to be patient and persevere in prayer. The times are 
coming when it will be bad, where there will be pain and suffering in every corner of the world, and 
when you will not have time to recover before another suffering befalls you. I am only His mother who 
points the way to Jesus.

I love you, my dear children, and I bless you, in the name of the Father, and of the Son, and of the Holy 
Spirit. I take your petitions into my most loving, Immaculate Heart and I will present them to the throne 
of God the Father and to Jesus and to the Holy Spirit. Thank you, my dear children, for all that you have 
done for me and my Son. Keep faithful, for the new time of peace
will come.

I bless you again and as I bless you, I shall depart. I shall depart, but yet I shall always remain with you
when, and especially when, you all pray. For each and every individual, I am with you when you pray, in 
the name of the Father, and of the Son, and of the Holy Spirit, as it was in the beginning, is now, and ever 
shall be, world without end, Amen. Thank you for responding to my most urgent and loving call. Go in 
the peace of God Most High, Ad Deum.

(Today when Our Lady came, I saw a light, then it was like I was going into this room and the room was 
Japanese. The walls were like wood and the panel on the ceilings were wood and white. It looked like a 
little chapel, no kneelers, just rugs to pray on. I saw a statue of Jesus and His Sacred Heart and I saw a 
beautiful little tabernacle, and then I saw a statue of Our Lady of All Nations made of dark wood and it 
was sorta like I was zooming in on the statue and I could see a glow around the statue and I could see 
tears coming out of her eyes. They were regular human tears that turned to blood and it was coming 
down. Then she asked me, “My dear child, can you hear me now?” I said to her “yes, I do” and then I 
sorta zoomed out just a little bit to where I could see most of the statue, not just the face, but the body and 
to where her feet came to, and the cross in the back. 

I got the sensation throughout the apparition that Our Lady wants us to pay attention to certain 
apparition sites and this one is one of her most important apparitions. She talked a lot about what she 
said in Akita and how it applies now. The Eucharistic Reign is here. She mentioned the Eucharist back 
then. She mentioned it today, that the chastisement has not come and that it can be avoided or possibly 
lessened and that will depend upon us and our prayers.

[Chris says Our Lady will appear on July 24th as The Virgin of the Poor.)
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